



CITY OF PORT ARTHUR TEXAS

Bid Tabulation

Road Building Materials

Bid Opening Date: January 25, 2017

Item #	Description	UOM	Name of Bidders					
			Unique Paving Materials Corp.			Knife River South		
			Stockpile	Plant	Worksite	Stockpile	Plant	Worksite
1a	Type 'PE' Grade 3 Precoated Aggregate	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
1b	Type 'PE' Grade 4 Precoated Aggregate	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Blackbase	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Limestone	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$27.00	\$22.00	\$27.00
4	610 Base Limestone	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	*\$43.00	*\$38.00	*\$43.00
5	Type "D" Hotmix Asphaltic Concrete PVT	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6	Hotmix Cold Laid Type "D" Asphaltic Concrete Pavement	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7	High Performance Hotmix Cold Laid Type "D" Asphaltic Concrete	Ton	No Bid	\$122.00	\$122.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
8	Romayor Sand	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9	Cement Stabilized Sand (Base Bid)	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$27.00	\$22.00	\$27.00
10a	½ sack incremental increase to base bid	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.00	\$3.00	\$3.00
10b	½ sack incremental decrease to base bid	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.00	\$3.00	\$3.00
11	Concrete Rubble 0"-8" size mixed	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12a	Hearth slag, 0" – 1½" size	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12b	Hearth slag, 1½" – 3" size	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
13	Grade 3 Commercial Rock	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$45.50	\$38.00	\$45.50
14	Grade 4 Commercial Rock	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
15	5/8" Limestone Aggregate	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Location			Cleveland, OH			Beaumont, TX		

Item #	Description	UOM	Name of Bidders					
			Martin Marietta			LD Construction		
			Stockpile	Plant	Worksite	Stockpile	Plant	Worksite
1a	Type 'PE' Grade 3 Precoated Aggregate	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$72.00	\$65.00	\$72.00
1b	Type 'PE' Grade 4 Precoated Aggregate	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$72.00	\$65.00	\$72.00
2	Blackbase	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$71.00	\$61.00	\$71.00
3	Limestone	Ton	\$28.00	\$24.00	\$28.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	610 Base Limestone	Ton	\$38.00	\$32.00	\$38.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	Type "D" Hotmix Asphaltic Concrete PVT	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$75.00	\$65.00	\$75.00
6	Hot-mix Cold Laid Type 'D' Asphaltic Concrete Pavement	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$80.00	\$72.00	\$80.00
7	High Performance Hotmix Cold Laid Type "D" Asphaltic Concrete	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
8	Romayor Sand	Ton	\$31.00	\$27.00	\$31.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9	Cement Stabilized Sand (Base Bid)	Ton	\$26.00	\$21.00	\$26.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
10a	½ sack incremental increase to base bid	Ton	\$3.00	\$3.00	\$3.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
10b	½ sack incremental decrease to base bid	Ton	\$3.00	\$3.00	\$3.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
11	Concrete Rubble 0"-8" size mixed	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12a	Hearth slag, 0" – 1½" size	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12b	Hearth slag, 1½" – 3" size	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
13	Grade 3 Commercial Rock	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
14	Grade 4 Commercial Rock	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
15	5/8" Limestone Aggregate	Ton	\$36.00	\$32.00	\$36.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Location			Beaumont, TX			Beaumont, TX		

Item #	Description	UOM	Name of Bidders					
			Redwine Enterprises, Inc.			Gulf Coast		
			Stockpile	Plant	Worksite	Stockpile	Plant	Worksite
1a	Type 'PE' Grade 3 Precoated Aggregate	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$69.25	\$63.00	\$69.25
1b	Type 'PE' Grade 4 Pre-coated Aggregate	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$69.25	\$63.00	\$69.25
2	Blackbase	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$62.90	\$52.00	\$62.90
3	Limestone	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	610 Base Limestone	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$38.00	\$31.75	\$38.00
5	Type "D" Hot-mix Asphaltic Concrete PVT	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$69.40	\$58.50	\$69.40
6	Hot-mix Cold Laid Type 'D' Asphaltic Concrete Pavement	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$71.25	\$65.00	\$71.25
7	High Performance Hotmix Cold Laid Type "D" Asphaltic Concrete	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$86.25	\$80.00	\$86.25
8	Romayor Sand	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9	Cement Stabilized Sand (Base Bid)	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
10a	½ sack incremental increase to base bid	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
10b	½ sack incremental decrease to base bid	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
11	Concrete Rubble 0"-8" size mixed	Ton	\$17.39	\$17.00	\$17.39	\$26.25	\$20.00	\$26.25
12a	Hearth slag, 0" – 1½" size	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12b	Hearth slag, 1½" – 3" size	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
13	Grade 3 Commercial Rock	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$47.25	\$41.00	\$47.25
14	Grade 4 Commercial Rock	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$47.25	\$41.00	\$47.25
15	5/8" Limestone Aggregate	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Location			Beaumont, TX			Beaumont, TX		

Item #	Description	UOM	Name of Bidders					
			Mid County Land Company, Ltd.			Martin Marietta		
			Stockpile	Plant	Worksite	Stockpile	Plant	Worksite
1a	Type 'PE' Grade 3 Precoated Aggregate	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$86.45	\$26.00	\$86.45
1b	Type 'PE' Grade 4 Pre-coated Aggregate	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$86.45	\$26.00	\$86.45
2	Blackbase	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Limestone	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	610 Base Limestone	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	Type "D" Hot-mix Asphaltic Concrete PVT	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6	Hot-mix Cold Laid Type 'D' Asphaltic Concrete Pavement	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7	High Performance Hotmix Cold Laid Type "D" Asphaltic Concrete	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
8	Romayor Sand	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9	Cement Stabilized Sand (Base Bid)	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
10a	½ sack incremental increase to base bid	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
10b	½ sack incremental decrease to base bid	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
11	Concrete Rubble 0"-8" size mixed	Ton	\$24.50	\$20.00	\$24.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12a	Hearth slag, 0" – 1½" size	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12b	Hearth slag, 1½" – 3" size	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
13	Grade 3 Commercial Rock	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
14	Grade 4 Commercial Rock	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
15	5/8" Limestone Aggregate	Ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Location			Nederland, TX			San Antonio, TX		

* Grey Limestone

Clifton Williams

Clifton Williams, CPPB, Acting Purchasing Manager

February 3, 2017

Date