
CITY OF PORT ARTHUR, TEXAS

Bid Tabulation

Mowing of Various City Properties, Parks Right-of-Ways

BID OPENING DATE: January 11, 2017

Group 1 Group 2 Group 3A Group 3B Group 5 Group 6 Group 9 Group 10 Group 11 Group 12

Bidder Location Ack Add Cost Per Cut Cost Per Cut Cost Per Cut Cost Per Cut Cost Per Cut Cost Per Cut Cost Per Cut Cost Per Cut Cost Per Cut Cost Per Cut

Flores Services Groves Yes 635.00$          695.00$           1,225.00$   1,525.00$    1,005.00$    1,625.00$      650.00$      450.00$      No Bid 1,685.00$       

Eagle Precision Lawn Care Nederland Yes 650.00$          470.00$           No Bid 1,365.00$    1,000.00$    No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Eduardo T.O. Landscaping Groves Yes 720.00$          500.00$           1,600.00$   1,300.00$    1,800.00$    1,500.00$      900.00$      240.00$      350.00$          1,300.00$       

Williams Transport Lumberton Yes No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 800.00$         No Bid 600.00$      175.00$          379.00$          

DMJ Landscaping Port Arthur Yes 499.00$          499.00$           898.80$      849.00$       1,150.00$    1,099.00$      499.99$      449.00$      300.00$          585.00$          

Amelia Lawn Care & Landscaping Groves Yes 515.00$          465.00$           No Bid No Bid 675.00$       955.00$         419.00$      379.00$      No Bid No Bid

South East Texas Lawn & Maint. Beaumont Yes 475.00$          485.00$           992.00$      992.00$       825.00$       740.00$         425.00$      350.00$      600.00$          520.00$          

Long Claw Contractors, LLC Seabrook Yes 580.00$          590.00$           575.00$      605.00$       625.00$       575.00$         500.00$      500.00$      560.00$          1,245.00$       

K&D Affordable Lawn Services Port Arthur Yes No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,200.00$      No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Lone Star Outdoor Svcs Lumberton Yes 675.00$          505.00$           No Bid No Bid 900.00$       1,350.00$      No Bid No Bid 250.00$          No Bid

F&L Unlimited Inc. Port Arthur Yes 1,710.00$       1,405.00$       1,200.00$   1,750.00$    No Bid 2,300.00$      No Bid 500.00$      No Bid No Bid

T & S Lawn Service Port Arthur Yes No Bid 400.00$           1,075.00$   No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 440.00$      No Bid No Bid

Derrick & Noah Lawn Service Port Arthur Yes 840.00$          1,000.00$       500.00$      800.00$       1,125.00$    1,000.00$      450.00$      400.00$      625.00$          1,625.00$       

W/J Lawn Care Port Arthur

U.B. Construction Services Port Arthur

Whit's Grass Cutting Port Arthur

Yolanda Scypion- Goudeaux , Purchasing Assistant 1/18/2017

Yolanda Scypion- Goudeaux , Purchasing Assistant Date

Disqualified

Disqualified

Disqualified


